

BUFFALO TOWNSHIP SUPERVISORS – SECONDARY MONTHLY MEETING – MAY 25, 2022

The Regular Monthly Meeting of the Buffalo Township Board of Supervisors was held Wednesday, May 25, 2022 and convened at 7:30 p.m. The Meeting was called to order by the Vice-Chairman, Matt Sweeny. This Meeting is being recorded, if anyone is taping this Meeting, please state your name and address.

ROLL CALL

Ron Zampogna III	Absent - Emailed
Matthew J. Sweeny	Present
Albert T. Roenigk	Present
Gary L. Risch Sr.	Present
Michael Oehling	Present

A majority of the Board of Supervisors being present, the Chairman declared the Meeting open for the transaction of business.

ANNOUNCEMENT OF EXECUTIVE SESSIONS; PERSONNEL; AND/OR INFO-GATHERING MEETINGS OF THE BOARD

- a) The Board of Supervisors met in the Township Building for an Executive Session with their Solicitor regarding personnel matters on May 25.

OLD BUSINESS

NEW BUSINESS

OPENING OF SEALED BIDS & AWARDING OF CONTRACTS FOR THE 2022 ROAD WORK

Albert Roenigk, Supervisor of Roads opened the sealed bids for the 2022 Road Work.

ITEM #1:

797 TON ASPHALT WEARING COURSE, 9.5MM, IN PLACE

Weist Asphalt	\$89.45 per ton	\$71,291.65
Shields Paving	\$84.83 per ton	\$67,609.51

ITEM #2:

1,732 TON ASPHALT WEARING COURSE, 9.5MM, IN PLACE

Weist Asphalt	\$89.45 per ton	\$154,927.40
Shields Paving	\$84.83 per ton	\$146,925.56

BUFFALO TOWNSHIP SUPERVISORS – SECONDARY MONTHLY MEETING – MAY 25, 2022

On a motion of Gary Risch, seconded by Michael Oehling to award Shields Paving with the lowest bid total price of \$214,535.07 for Item #1 & Item #2. Motion Carried. Un. Approval.

ITEM #1:

41,060 S.Y. SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT, IN PLACE, SRL-G

Russel Standard	\$2.35 per S.Y.	\$96,491.00
Young Blood	\$2.20 per S.Y.	\$90,332.00
Midland	\$2.73 per S.Y.	\$112,093.80

ITEM #2

17,793 S.Y. ASPHALT FOG SEAL FOR ASPHALT SEAL COATS

Russel Standard	\$0.75 per S.Y.	\$13,344.75
Young Blood	\$1.20 per S.Y.	\$21,351.61
Midland	\$0.76 per S.Y.	\$13,522.68

ITEM #3

18,334 S.Y. SINGLE ASPHALT FIBER REINFORCED SEAL COAT, IN PLACE, SRL-G

Russel Standard	\$3.08 per S.Y.	\$56,468.72
Young Blood	No Bid	No Bid
Midland	\$4.40 per S.Y.	\$80,669.60

ITEM #4

18,334 S.Y. SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT, IN PLACE, SRL-G

Russel Standard	\$2.18 per S.Y.	\$39,968.12
Young Blood	\$2.20 per S.Y.	\$40,334.80
Midland	\$2.73 per S.Y.	\$50,051.52

BUFFALO TOWNSHIP SUPERVISORS – SECONDARY MONTHLY MEETING – MAY 25, 2022

ITEM #5

15,914 S.Y. SINGLE ASPHALT FIBER REINFORCED SEAL COAT, IN PLACE , SRL-G

Russel Standard	\$3.08 per S.Y.	\$49,015.12
Young Blood	No Bid	No Bid
Midland	\$4.40 per S.Y.	\$70,021.60

ITEM #6

15,914 S.Y. SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT, IN PLACE, SRL-G

Russel Standard	\$2.18 per S.Y.	\$34,692.00
Young Blood	\$2.20 per S.Y.	\$35,010.80
Midland	\$2.73 per S.Y.	\$43,445.22

ITEM #7

15,914 S.Y. ASPHALT FOG SEAL FOR ASPHALT SEAL COAT

Russel Standard	\$0.75 per S.Y.	\$11,935.50
Young Blood	\$1.20 per S.Y.	\$19,096.80
Midland	\$0.76 per S.Y.	\$12,094.64

ITEM #8

19,246 S.Y. SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT, IN PLACE, SRL-G

Russel Standard	\$2.18 per S.Y.	\$41,956.28
Young Blood	\$2.20 per S.Y.	\$42,341.20
Midland	\$2.73 per S.Y.	\$52,541.58

On a motion of Mike Oehling, seconded by Gary Risch to table Asphalt Item #1 thru Item #8 at this time. Motion Carried. Un. Approval.

BUFFALO TOWNSHIP SUPERVISORS – SECONDARY MONTHLY MEETING – MAY 25, 2022

MOTION TO ADOPT RESOLUTION #2022-13 AUTHORIZING RICHARD G. HILL, TOWNSHIP MANAGER TO SIGN TRAIL GRANT AGREEMENT

On a motion of Michael Oehling, seconded by Albert Roenigk to adopt Resolution #2022-13 authorizing Richard G. Hill, Township Manager to sign Trail Grant Agreement. Motion Carried. Un. Approval.

MOTION TO ACCEPT 2022 MULTI-MODAL TRANSPORTATION FUND GRANT

Rich Hill, Township Manager stated that this is for the formal acceptance of the grant for the Harvey Road Project.

On a motion of Michael Oehling, seconded by Albert Roenigk to accept the 2022 Multi-Modal Transportation Fund Grant. Motion Carried. Un. Approval.

MOTION TO APPROVE PAVING PROPOSAL FROM WINFIELD TOWNSHIP FOR CRUIKSHANK ROAD IN BUFFALO TOWNSHIP

Rich Hill, Township Manager spoke and stated that it will cost the Township \$8,300.00 for Winfield Township to pave the balance of Cruikshank Road located in Buffalo Township.

On a motion of Albert Roenigk, seconded by Michael Oehling to approve Paving Proposal from Winfield Township for Cruikshank Road in Buffalo Township. Motion Carried. Un. Approval.

MOTION TO APPROVE AGREEMENT TO PROVIDE TRAFFIC ENGINEERING SERVICES REGARDING A ROADWAY SUFFICIENCY ANALYSIS

Atty. Farrington stated that Bankson Engineers does not perform Traffic Studies. It will cost \$28,850.00 for HRG to supply us with this professional service which will also help with the Re-evaluation of Zoning as well as the Comprehensive Plan.

On a motion of Michael Oehling, seconded by Gary Risch to approve agreement with HRG to provide Traffic Engineering Services regarding a Roadway Sufficiency Analysis. Motion Carried. Un. Approval.

REMARKS FROM THE FLOOR:

Bob Fletcher asked about 282 Bear Creek Road. The people that live there have a clean out business and put items that they want to give away in their front yard for people to take. The concern is that people stopping along the road are causing a safety issue. Matt Sweeny suggested that Rick Healy go and talk with them and try to figure out an alternative idea.

BUFFALO TOWNSHIP SUPERVISORS – SECONDARY MONTHLY MEETING – MAY 25, 2022

Bob Fletcher, Township Road Master stated that the work at Crescent Hill Drive has been completed and Albert suggested that guardrail be installed at some time. Mr. Slater resident of Crescent Hill Drive was thanked for feeding the Township Road workers and being helpful to all the residents needing to get in and out of the road while it was being worked on.

Atty. Farrington stated that the Traffic Impact Fee Board will be meeting prior to the June 1st Planning Commission Meeting.

ADJOURNMENT was on motion of Gary Risch, seconded by Albert Roenigk, at 8:10 p.m. Motion Carried.
Un. Approval.

APPROVED:

CHAIRMAN

SECRETARY/TREASURER